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Candle Maker Starter Kit 

Instruction Sheet 
We hope you enjoy this kit and share your creations with us on social media! 

 

 

Step 1 – Measure out the wax 

Start by scooping out the wax flakes and pouring them into the Candle Maker pouring pot. Inside the pot, you 
will see 3 lines with different measurements. If you would like to make 1 candle at a time, fill the pot with soy 
flakes up to the 16oz line. If you would like to make 2 candles at a time, fill the pot up to the 32oz line.  

Note: The amount of wax you are adding will not equal the same amount you are seeing on the fill line. These 
instructions are using those lines as more of a guide than exact measurements. 

Step 2 – Melt the wax 

Once you have added the desired amount of wax to the pouring pot, place the pot on the burner and tap the 
first icon on the Candle Maker base. Depending on the amount of wax you are using, the melt time may differ. 
If the Candle Maker completes the cycle and your wax is not completely melted, tap the first icon again to 
send it through the cycle a second time. 

Step 3 – Add the fragrance oil 

Once the Candle Maker has completed the melting cycle and all the wax is melted, the Candle Maker will 
chime and it’s time to add your fragrance oil! Choose from one of the 1oz fragrance oils included in your kit 
and pour it into the pot. If you are making 1 candle, you will use ½ of the 1oz bottle. If you’re making 2 
candles, use a full 1oz bottle of your desired fragrance. Once you have completed this step, tap the second 
icon on the Candle Maker base. 

Step 4 – Stir the wax mixture 

One of the best things about the Candle Maker is that it stirs the wax for you! The little wheel found at the 
bottom of the pouring pot will spin and slowly stir the wax. When the Candle Maker is done stirring the wax 
mixture, you will hear a chime and it’s time to pour! 

Step 5 – Prepare your container(s) 

While the wax is being stirred by the Candle Maker, you can prepare your container(s). Start by adhering one 
of the wick stickers to the metal wick tab on the bottom of the wick and then center the wick inside the jar.  

Note: You can use a hard plastic or metal straw to help adhere the wick to the inside of the jar. Simply thread 
the wick through the straw, center the wick, and press firmly. 
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Step 6 – Pour the wax into the container(s) 

When the Candle Maker has finished stirring the wax mixture, you will hear a chime and it’s time to pour the 
wax into your containers! Gently remove the pot from the base and slowly pour the wax into your containers, 
being careful not to splash the wax. Once the containers are filled, use a wick bar to center the wick by placing 
it across the top of the jar and sliding the wick into the notch in the center of the wick bar.  

Note: It is recommended to preheat the containers to help avoid wet spots or separation between the wax and 
the glass. You can do this by warming the container(s) with a heat gun or hair dryer or by putting the jars in a 
warm oven for a few minutes. 

Step 7 – Allow the candles to cool & cure 

Depending on the ambient temperature in the room, it should take a couple of hours for the wax to 
completely cool. Once the wax is cool, you can trim the wick to about 1/8 – 1/4 of an inch above the top of the 
wax. Next, add a lid and a caution label and you’re done! We recommend allowing your candles to cure with 
the lid on for at least a week. Doing this will help your scent throw to be stronger. 

That’s it! 

You are ready to package them for gifting or selling or to enjoy yourself!  

 

 

 

 


